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INFLOWS OF ASYLUM SEEKERS

TO OECD COUNTRIES

Every year hundreds of thousands of people leave
their homes to flee international or civil conflicts or
persecution of minorities. Most of them come from
low or middle income countries, and a large share of
the people fleeing persecution seek sanctuary else-
where in their own country or in nearby countries.
Those who end up seeking asylum in OECD coun-
tries therefore represent just a small fraction of the
people who are displaced against their will. 

A key instrument in international refugee policy is
the 1951 UN Convention Relating to the Status of

Refugees. Central aspects of the convention still
shape refugee policy today. According to the defini-
tions in the convention, a refugee is a person who has
fled his or her country or habitual residence because
of persecution or a well-founded fear of persecution
on account of race, religion, nationality, membership
of a particular social group, or political opinion. An
asylum-seeker is an individual that claims to be a
refugee and applies for sanctuary in a country. Each
claim of refugee status must be considered on its
individual merits by the signatory country that the
asylum seeker has applied to, and the signatory state
has to provide access to procedures for determining
whether a person claiming asylum qualifies as a
refugee according to the Convention’s definition. 

The United Nations High Commissioner of
Refugees (UNHCR) collects comprehensive statis-
tics on refugees and asylum seekers. Table 1 depicts
the asylum seeker inflows to 19 leading OECD des-
tination countries in 1989–2010. The largest inflows
were received by Germany, the United States, the
United Kingdom, France and Canada. 

The numbers of asylum seekers reflect conflicts and
the humanitarian situation in their countries of ori-
gin, but there is no uniform trend in inflows of asy-
lum seekers across different countries. Refugee poli-
cies also play a role in determining the different
trends between countries. Safe third country provi-
sions represent one such policy.

Safe third country provisions are a form of cost shift
and inflow control in OECD countries that follow on
from the 1990 Dublin Convention, and were gradu-
ally incorporated into the asylum systems of individ-

ual countries. A safe third country is a country that
the asylum-seeker has passed through on the way to
the receiving country and with which the latter has
an agreement. Under an agreement, the receiving
country can refuse to examine an asylum application
if the country an asylum seeker has passed through
is technically responsible for doing so.The purpose
of the safe third country policies was to prevent ‘asy-
lum shopping’, and major recipients of asylum seek-
ers in the EU have generally advocated agreements
between the member states to shift some asylum
determination responsibilities to other countries.

Safe third country provisions are probably responsi-
ble for some of the shift in the distribution of asy-
lum-seekers between countries in the EU, in cases
where asylum seekers are more likely to claim asy-
lum from countries that are more easily reachable
from outside the EU.

Ilpo Kauppinen
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